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About
Green Belt Motor Club

Green Belt Motor Club is one of the
largest and most active motor clubs in
the Hertfordshire/North London area.
The Club has a large and varied
programme of both motor sport and
social events with something to offer
almost anyone who is interested in
motoring and motor sport.
For nearly 40 years Green Belt Motor
Club has been organising road rallies,
special stage rallies, autotests, sprints,
autocrosses etc. The club also holds a
number of social events each year,
including an annual Dinner & Dance,
visits, and Treasure Hunt.
Green Belt Motor Club runs a total of
seventeen Annual Championships which
are open to all members with awards
being presented to the most successful
competitors in most areas of motor sport.
The Club enjoys a first class Club
Magazine which is published every
month, detailing club activities, motor
sporting and social events. Previews,
reports, results and opinions of all kinds
feature regularly.
All members may contribute to and
advertise in the magazine. The club runs
its own website:

www.greenbeltmc.org.uk

Meetings are held weekly and an annual
series of "Rally School" classes is held,
designed to teach novices the sport of
rallying.
The Club is keen to encourage
newcomers to the sport, having no fewer
than three Club Championships designed
specifically for novices. These enable
beginners to take part in short
navigational rallies, treasure hunts, night
trials etc.

Green Belt Motor Club meets every
Wednesday evening from 9.30 p.m. at:

The Two Brewers
Northaw Road West

Northaw
Hertfordshire

Map Ref. 166/279022

Potential new members are very
welcome to attend these informal
meetings. Further information about the
Club can be obtained from the Hon.
Secretary:

Chris Deal
209 Latymer Road

London
N9 9PN

Tel. 07920 840689
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